
  

  

Court File No. 19-69485 

 

ONTARIO 

SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

COMMERCIAL LIST 
 

 
BETWEEN: 

CANADIAN IMPERIAL BANK OF COMMERCE 

Applicant 

- and – 

 

AMAX HEALTH INC. 

Respondent 

 

 

FOURTH REPORT OF THE RECEIVER  

 

June 8, 2020 



 

 

Table of Contents 

I. INTRODUCTION ..................................................................................................... 1 

Purpose of the Fourth Report ............................................................................ 4 

Terms of Reference ........................................................................................... 5 

II. BACKGROUND ...................................................................................................... 6 

III. RECEIVER’S ACTIVITIES SINCE THE THIRD REPORT ...................................... 7 

IV. ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE .................................................................................... 8 

VI. LIEN CLAIM OF PROVINCE OF BRITISH COLUMBIA ......................................... 9 

VII. MONERIS SOLUTIONS CORPORATION ............................................................ 10 

VIII. BANKRUPTCY ..................................................................................................... 10 

IX. RECEIVER’S INTERIM STATEMENT OF RECEIPTS AND DISBURSEMENTS 11 

XI. FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS OF THE RECEIVER AND COUNSEL ............... 12 

XII. CONCLUSION ...................................................................................................... 14 

 

  



 

 

Appendices 

Appointment Order .......................................................................................................... A 

First Report of the Receiver dated July 17, 2019, without appendices ............................ B 

July 25 Order ................................................................................................................... C 

Second Report of the Receiver dated August 22, 2019, without appendices .................. D 

Approval and Vesting Order ............................................................................................ E 

Third Report of the Receiver dated October 17, 2019, without appendices .................... F 

October 24 Order ........................................................................................................... G 

October 31st Letter .......................................................................................................... H 

November 22nd Letter  ...................................................................................................... I 

Certificate of Appointment ............................................................................................... J 

Receiver’s Interim Statement of Receipts and Disbursements ........................................ K 

Affidavit of Arif Dhanani ................................................................................................... L 

Affidavit of Kaush Parameswaran   ................................................................................ M 

Affidavit of Amanda Plastina  .......................................................................................... N 

Affidavit of Graham F. Alloway  ...................................................................................... O 

  

  

 

 

 



 

1 

 

I. INTRODUCTION  

1. By Order of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial List) (the 

“Court”) dated June 4, 2019 (the “Appointment Order”), RSM Canada 

Limited (“RSM”) was appointed receiver (the “Receiver”), without security, 

of all of the assets, undertakings and properties of Amax Health Inc. (“Amax” 

or the “Debtor”) acquired for, or used in relation to a business carried on by 

the Debtor (the “Property”).  A copy of the Appointment Order is attached 

hereto as Appendix “A”. 

2. The Appointment Order authorizes the Receiver to, among other things: 

a) take possession of and exercise control over the Property and any and 

all proceeds, receipts and disbursements arising out of or from the 

Property;  

b) manage, operate, and carry on the business of the Debtor, including the 

powers to enter into any agreements, incur any obligations in the 

ordinary course of business, cease to carry on all or any part of the 

business, or cease to perform any contracts of the Debtor; 

c) receive and collect all monies and accounts now owed or hereafter 

owing to the Debtor and to exercise all remedies of the Debtor in 

collecting such monies, including, without limitation, to enforce any 

security held by the Debtor; and 

d) market any or all of the Property, including advertising and soliciting 

offers in respect of the Property or any part or parts thereof and 

negotiating such terms and conditions of sale as the Receiver in its 

discretion may deem appropriate. 

3. The Receiver’s first report to the Court dated July 17, 2019 (the “First 

Report”) provided information on the Receiver’s activities from the date of 

the Appointment Order to July 12, 2019 and sought, inter alia:  (i) certain 
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relief from the Court in respect of the Receiver’s sales process described 

therein and (ii) authorization to make distributions to Canadian Imperial Bank 

of Commerce (“CIBC”). A copy of the First Report, without appendices, is 

attached hereto as Appendix “B”.  

4. On July 25, 2019, the Honourable Justice Parayeski made an Order (the 

“July 25 Order”): 

a) approving the First Report and the Receiver’s conduct set out therein; 

b) approving the Receiver’s interim statement of receipts and 

disbursements as at July 11, 2019; 

c) sealing the Receiver’s Confidential Information Memorandum dated July 

25, 2019 until further order of the Court; 

d) authorizing the making of interim distributions to CIBC; and 

e) approving the fees of the Receiver and its counsel.  

A copy of the July 25 Order is attached hereto as Appendix “C”. 

5. The Receiver’s second report to the Court dated August 22, 2019 (the 

“Second Report”) provided information on the Receiver’s activities from the 

date of the First Report to August 21, 2019 and sought, inter alia:  (i) the 

Court’s approval for the Receiver to enter into an agreement of purchase 

and sale between the Receiver and 11509349 Canada Inc.; (ii) an Order 

sealing certain confidential appendices; and (iii) authorizing the Receiver to 

file an assignment in bankruptcy on behalf of the Debtor. A copy of the 

Second Report, without appendices, is attached hereto as Appendix “D”.  

6. On September 3, 2019, the Honourable Justice Parayeski made an Order 

(the “Approval and Vesting Order”): 
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a) authorizing the Receiver to enter into and carry out the terms of the Sale 

Agreement (as defined therein);  

b) approving the Second Report and the Receiver’s conduct set out 

therein; 

c) approving the Receiver’s interim statement of receipts and 

disbursements as at August 16, 2019; 

d) authorizing the Receiver to file an assignment in bankruptcy on behalf 

of the Debtor; 

e) sealing certain confidential appendices until further order of the Court;  

and 

f) approving the fees of the Receiver and its counsel.  

A copy of the Approval and Vesting Order is attached hereto as Appendix 

“E”. 

7. The Receiver’s third report to the Court dated October 17, 2019 (the “Third 

Report”) provided information on the Receiver’s activities from the date of 

the Second Report to October 15, 2019 including the closing of the sale of 

Amax’s assets, and sought, inter alia, the Court’s approval for the Receiver 

to make distributions to CIBC provided that the aggregate amount of all 

distributions made to CIBC was not to, without further order of the Court, 

exceed the aggregate obligations owing to CIBC by the Debtor pursuant to 

the terms of the Business Loan, as defined in the Third Report. A copy of the 

Third Report, without appendices, is attached hereto as Appendix “F”.  

8. On October 24, 2019, the Honourable Justice Carpenter-Gunn made an 

Order (the “October 24 Order”): 

a) approving the Third Report and the Receiver’s conduct set out therein; 
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b) approving the Receiver’s interim statement of receipts and 

disbursements as at September 30, 2019; 

c) approving the fees of the Receiver and its counsel; and 

d) authorizing the Receiver to make distributions to CIBC provided that the 

aggregate amount of all distributions made to CIBC did not, without 

further order of the Court, exceed the aggregate obligations owing to 

CIBC by Amax. 

A copy of the October 24 Order is attached hereto as Appendix “G”. 

9. The Orders made by the Court and the reports of the Receiver referred to in 

this report, together with related Court documents, have been posted on the 

Receiver’s website, which can be found at https://rsmcanada.com/what-we-

do/services/consulting/financial-advisory/restructuring-recovery/current-

restructuring-recovery-engagements/amax-health-inc.html 

Purpose of the Fourth Report 

10. The purpose of this fourth report of the Receiver (the “Fourth Report”) is to: 

a) provide the Court with details regarding the activities of the Receiver 

since the date of the Third Report to June 8, 2020;  

b) provide the Court with a summary of the Receiver’s cash receipts and 

disbursements for the period June 4, 2019 to June 8, 2020; and 

c) seek an order from the Court: 

i. approving the Fourth Report and the Receiver’s conduct and 

activities described herein; 

ii. approving the R&D, as defined below;  



 

5 

 

iii. approving the fees and disbursements of the Receiver for the 

period October 1, 2019 to May 31, 2020 and estimated fees to 

completion of the receivership administration;  

iv. approving the fees of the Receiver’s counsel, Scarfone Hawkins 

LLP (“Scarfone Hawkins”) for the period October 1, 2019 to <*> 

and estimated fees to completion of the receivership 

administration; 

v. approving the fees of Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP (“Norton 

Rose”) and those of Alloway and Associates Professional 

Corporation (“Alloway”), the Receiver’s independent counsel in 

Alberta and Ontario, respectively, who provided legal opinions on 

the validity and enforceability of CIBC’s security in the provinces 

of Alberta and Ontario;  

vi. discharging the Receiver upon the Receiver filing a certificate with 

the Court certifying that it has completed the Remaining Duties, as 

defined later herein (the “Receiver’s Discharge Certificate”), and 

authorizing the Receiver to complete certain administrative 

matters following the discharge of the Receiver; and 

vii. authorizing the Receiver to transfer to the bankruptcy estate of the 

Company (i) the funds remaining in the Receiver’s trust account 

upon its discharge as Receiver; and (ii) any funds that may be 

received by the Receiver after its discharge. 

Terms of Reference 

11. In preparing this Fourth Report and making the comments herein, the 

Receiver has relied upon information from third-party sources (collectively, 

the “Information”). Certain of the information contained in this Fourth Report 

may refer to, or is based on, the Information. As the Information has been 
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provided by other parties, or obtained from documents filed with the Court in 

this matter, the Receiver has relied on the Information and, to the extent 

possible, reviewed the Information for reasonableness. However, the 

Receiver has not audited or otherwise attempted to verify the accuracy or 

completeness of the Information in a manner that would wholly or partially 

comply with Canadian Auditing Standards pursuant to the Chartered 

Professional Accountants Canada Handbook and, accordingly, the Receiver 

expresses no opinion or other form of assurance in respect of the 

Information. 

12. Unless otherwise stated, all dollar amounts contained in the Fourth Report 

are expressed in Canadian dollars. 

13. Defined terms in this Fourth Report have, unless indicated otherwise herein, 

the same meanings as set out in the First Report, the Second Report and 

the Third Report. 

II. BACKGROUND  

14. On September 1, 2018, Cheeta Alliance Inc., Amax Dental Alberta Inc., 

Amax Dental Supply B.C. Inc. and Amax Dental Ontario Inc. were 

amalgamated to form Amax.  Amax is an Ontario corporation and distributed 

dental supplies and related equipment throughout Canada.  

15. Amax operated from leased facilities located at 1-27 Seapark Drive in St. 

Catharines, Ontario (“Ontario”), 4900-64th Avenue SE in Calgary, Alberta 

(“Alberta”) and 22 Rue J-Marc Seguin in Rigaud, Quebec (“Quebec”).   

Amax’s head office was located at the Ontario location and its inventory was 

housed at, and distributed from, the Ontario and Alberta locations.  The 

Quebec location was a sales office containing limited office furniture and 

equipment.  
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16. According to a corporation profile report dated May 23, 2019, Messrs. 

Carman Dennis Adair, Joseph Taylor Robertson and Clark Robertson are 

listed as the directors of Amax.  A copy of the corporation profile report for 

Amax is appended as Appendix “B” to the Second Report. 

17. CIBC provided Amax with a $1,000,000 revolving credit facility by way of 

loan agreement dated January 8, 2019 (the “Business Loan”), which is 

secured by a general security agreement in favour of CIBC.   

18. As Amax was in default of its obligations under the Business Loan and by 

notice of application dated June 3, 2019 (“Application”), CIBC sought the 

appointment of the Receiver. 

19. On June 4, 2019, the Court issued the Appointment Order in which RSM was 

appointed as Receiver of Amax. 

20. Scarfone Hawkins is counsel to CIBC. The Receiver has primarily utilized 

Scarfone Hawkins as counsel for the receivership administration, except in 

circumstances where independent legal advice is required by the Receiver.   

III. RECEIVER’S ACTIVITIES SINCE THE THIRD REPORT 

21. The Receiver’s significant activities, since the issuance of the Third Report, 

certain of which are discussed in detail further below in this Fourth Report, 

have consisted of: 

a) arranging for the preparation of 2019 T4s and Releve 1s and related 

documents in respect of Amax’s former employees; 

b) reviewing and resolving employee claims related to the Wage Earner 

Protection Program Act; 

c) collecting of accounts receivable; and 

d) filing of outstanding HST returns and outstanding corporate tax returns.  
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IV. ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE 

22. In early September 2019, Amax’s outstanding pre-receivership accounts 

receivable having a book value totaling $64,061 were sent for collection to a 

collection agency, Collection Group of Canada (“CGC”).   

23. As of March 6, 2020, CGC had collected $36,743 resulting in net realizations 

to the Receiver of $27,727.  CGC has advised that the remaining accounts 

receivable totaling $27,318 are not collectible and CGC has ceased 

collection efforts and closed its files. 

24. The Receiver does not propose to take any further action in connection with 

the accounts receivable other than forwarding any additional funds collected 

by CGC, net of its fees, to the bankruptcy estate. 

V. OUTSTANDING HST REFUND 

25. The Receiver has filed HST returns to claim for input tax credits for the post-

receivership period. Based on the returns filed to January 31, 2020, the 

Receiver is claiming an HST refund of approximately $30,000.   

26. Canada Revenue Agency (“CRA”) advised the Receiver that no refunds 

owed to the Receiver will be released by CRA unless the outstanding HST 

returns for the pre-receivership period were filed. The last return filed by 

Amax was for the period ended June 30, 2017.  The Receiver advised CRA 

that the Receiver could not rely on the books and records of the Debtor to 

prepare the outstanding returns. CRA advised that in such circumstances a 

Receiver could file “nil” returns.  The Receiver prepared “nil” returns for the 

period July 1, 2017 to June 4, 2019 and has filed those returns with CRA. 

27. CRA’s position is that unless the outstanding corporation tax returns are filed 

or a waiver is granted by CRA, no HST refunds will be released to the filer. 
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28. Amax was also not up-to-date in its filing of corporate tax returns and, as 

discussed with CRA, the returns for the three periods January 1 to August 

31, 2018, September 1 to December 31, 2018 and January 1 to October 29, 

2019 (the date of bankruptcy) were outstanding. As the Receiver does not 

have the necessary information to prepare the outstanding returns, the 

Receiver has applied for a waiver of the requirement to file a corporation 

income tax return that CRA may grant to an insolvency practitioner.  The 

Receiver is awaiting CRA’s response to its request.   

VI. LIEN CLAIM OF PROVINCE OF BRITISH COLUMBIA  

29. As set out in the Receiver’s Second Report, the British Columbia Ministry of 

Finance (the “Ministry”) registered a lien against the Debtor’s property in the 

amount of $19,726.04 pursuant to section 221 of the Provincial Sales Tax 

Act (the “Ministry Lien”).  

30. As set out in the Receiver’s Third Report, the Receiver understands from the 

Ministry that the lien amount is based on an arbitrary assessment by the 

Ministry, which was issued as a result of Amax’s non-compliance with its 

reporting obligations.   

31. The Receiver wrote to the Ministry on October 31, 2019 (the “October 31st 

Letter”) to advise that the Receiver’s position was that the Ministry Lien was 

ineffective and an unsecured claim against Amax on the basis that the 

Ministry’s assessment was arbitrary and its lien registration occurred 

subsequent to commencement of the receivership administration and stay 

of proceedings against Amax.  The Receiver requested that the Ministry 

advise of its position by November 15, 2019.  A copy of the October 31st 

Letter is attached hereto as Appendix “H”. 

32. The Receiver did not receive a response from the Ministry and on November 

22, 2019, the Receiver followed up with a second letter (the “November 22nd 

Letter”) requesting that the Ministry respond by November 29, 2019 or, if no 
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response was received from the Ministry, the Receiver would attend in Court 

to put forward the Receiver’s position set out in the October 31st Letter.  A 

copy of the November 22nd Letter is attached hereto as Appendix “I”. 

33. On November 22, 2019, the Ministry contacted the Receiver to advise that 

the Ministry had no issue with the Receiver’s position and that the Ministry 

would:  (i) discharge the Ministry Lien; and (ii) file an unsecured claim against 

the bankrupt estate of Amax.  

34. The Ministry has filed an unsecured claim in the bankruptcy administration 

of Amax and Scarfone Hawkins has confirmed that the Ministry Lien has 

been discharged. 

VII. MONERIS SOLUTIONS CORPORATION 

35. In the Third Report, the Receiver reported that Moneris Solutions 

Corporation (“Moneris”) was holding a reserve (deposit retention) of 

approximately $60,000 in respect of the Amax accounts (the “Holdback”) 

and that Moneris agreed to release the balance in increments of $20,000 in 

30, 60 and 90 days’ time. 

36. On November 1, 2019, Moneris advised the Receiver that it would release 

the balance in increments of $15,000 in 30, 60, 90 and 120 days’ time.  The 

fourth and final payment of $15,000 was received from Moneris on February 

4, 2020. 

VIII. BANKRUPTCY 

37. Paragraph 11 of the Approval and Vesting Order authorized the Receiver to 

file an assignment in bankruptcy on behalf of Amax.  
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38. According to the terms of the agreement of purchase and sale between the 

Receiver and 11509349 Canada Inc., the Receiver was required to change 

the name of Amax.   

39. On October 11, 2019, pursuant to Articles of Amendment filed by the 

Receiver, the name of the Debtor was changed from Amax Health Inc. to 

1992396 Ontario Inc. (the “Company”). 

40. On October 29, 2019, the Receiver filed an assignment in bankruptcy on 

behalf of the Company. A copy of the Certificate of Appointment is attached 

as Appendix “J” to this report. 

41. As of the date of this report, surplus funds totaling $160,000 have been 

transferred from the receivership to the bankruptcy estate.   

42. The Receiver intends to transfer any remaining additional surplus funds, 

after payment of its fees and costs associated with the receivership 

administration, to the bankruptcy estate. The Receiver is therefore 

requesting an Order authorizing the Receiver to transfer to the bankruptcy 

estate of the Company (i) the funds remaining in the Receiver’s trust account 

upon its discharge as Receiver; and (ii) any as well as any funds that may 

be received by the Receiver after its discharge.  

IX. RECEIVER’S INTERIM STATEMENT OF RECEIPTS AND DISBURSEMENTS 

43. Attached hereto as Appendix “K” is the Receiver`s Interim Statement of 

Receipts and Disbursements for the period June 4, 2019 to June 8, 2020 

(the “R&D”).  During this period, receipts were $1,950,367 and 

disbursements were $864,402, resulting in an excess of receipts over 

disbursements of $1,085,965. After repayments of $821,900 CIBC, 

representing payment in full of Amax’s indebtedness to CIBC and the 

transfer of $160,000 to the bankruptcy estate, the Receiver’s net cash 

balance as at June 8, 2020 was $104,065. 
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X. DISCHARGE OF THE RECEIVER 

44. As of the date of the Fourth Report, the Receiver’s remaining duties (the 

“Remaining Duties”) include the following: 

a) collection of any remaining collectible accounts receivable; 

b) following up with CRA in respect of HST refunds owed to the Receiver 

and closing the Receiver’s HST account;  

c) transfer of any additional surplus funds to the bankruptcy estate for 

distribution to unsecured creditors;  

d) closing the Receiver’s bank account; and 

e) preparing the Interim and Final Statements of Receiver pursuant to 

s.246(2) and s. 246(3) of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act. 

45. As the Receiver’s administration is substantially complete, and in order to 

avoid the costs of making a further motion to the Court to obtain the 

Receiver’s discharge, the Receiver is presently seeking an order discharging 

RSM from the powers, duties and obligations attendant to its appointment 

as Receiver (the “Discharge Order”) upon the filing of the Receiver’s 

Discharge Certificate, with the proviso that RSM may perform such incidental 

duties as may be required by it as Receiver to complete its obligations 

pursuant to its appointment as Receiver including, but not limited to, the 

Remaining Duties. 

XI. FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS OF THE RECEIVER AND COUNSEL 

46. Pursuant to paragraph 17 of the Appointment Order, the Receiver and its 

counsel are to be paid their reasonable fees and disbursements at their 

standard rates and charges, incurred both before and after the making of the 
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Appointment Order.  Pursuant to paragraph 18 of the Appointment Order, 

the Receiver and its counsel shall pass their accounts before the Court. 

47. The fees and disbursements of the Receiver for the period from May 23, 

2019 to September 30, 2019 were previously approved by the Court 

pursuant to the July 25 Order, the Approval and Vesting Order and the 

October 24 Order. 

48. The total fees of the Receiver for the period October 1, 2019 to May 31, 2020 

were $29,792.50, plus disbursements of $82.43, plus HST of $3,883.74 for 

a total of $33,758.67, and estimated to completion in an amount not to 

exceed $15,000.00 plus HST.  The time spent by the Receiver is more 

particularly described in the Affidavit of Arif Dhanani sworn June 8, 2020, 

which is attached hereto and marked as Appendix “L” and contains a copy 

of the invoice that sets out the services provided during this time period.  

49. The fees and disbursements of Scarfone Hawkins for the period from June 

5, 2019 to September 30, 2019 were previously approved by the Court 

pursuant to the July 25 Order, the Approval and Vesting Order and the 

October 24 Order. 

50. The total fees of Scarfone Hawkins for the period October 1, 2019 to May 29, 

2020 were $14,488.75 plus disbursements of $1,041.01 and HST of 

$1,957.78, for a total of $17,487.54, and estimated to completion in the 

amount of $5,320.00 plus HST.  The time spent by Scarfone Hawkins is more 

particularly described in the Affidavit of Kaush Parameswaran, sworn June 8, 

2020, which is attached hereto as Appendix “M” and contains, among other 

things, a copy of the invoice that sets out the services provided during this 

period.  

51. The total fees of the Receiver’s Alberta counsel, Norton Rose, who reviewed 

the security of CIBC in Alberta, for the period of August 9, 2019 to September 

26, 2019 were $3,594.34 inclusive of HST and disbursements.  The time 
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spent by Norton Rose is more particularly described in the Affidavit of 

Amanda Plastina, sworn October 7, 2019, which is attached hereto as 

Appendix “N” and contains a copy of the invoice that sets out the services 

provided during the relevant period. 

52. The total fees of the Receiver’s Ontario counsel, Alloway, who reviewed the 

security of CIBC in Ontario, for the period of June 24, 2019 to September 

30, 2019 were $3,840.94 inclusive of HST and disbursements.  The time 

spent by Alloway is more particularly described in the Affidavit of Graham F. 

Alloway, sworn October 17, 2019, which is attached hereto as Appendix “O” 

and contains a copy of the invoice that sets out the services provided during 

the relevant period   

53. The Receiver is of the view that the fees and disbursements charged by 

Scarfone Hawkins, Norton Rose and Alloway are fair and reasonable. 

XII. CONCLUSION 

54. Based on the foregoing, the Receiver respectfully requests that the Court grant 

the order described in paragraph 10(c) above. 

All of which is respectfully submitted to this Court as of this 8th day of June, 2020. 

RSM CANADA LIMITED, solely in its capacity as  
Court-Appointed Receiver of Amax Health Inc.,  
and not in its personal or corporate capacity 
 

Per:  
 

Arif Dhanani, CPA, CA, CIRP, LIT 
 Vice-President 
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APPENDIX J 



District of: Ontario
Division No.: 07 - Hamilton
Court No.: 32-2576492
Estate No.: 32-2576492

In the Matter of the Bankruptcy of:

1992396 ONTARIO INC.
Debtor

RSM Canada Limited
Licensed Insolvency Trustee

Ordinary Administration

Date and time of bankruptcy: October 29, 2019, 12:13 Security: $0.00

Date of trustee appointment: October 29, 2019

Meeting of creditors: November 18, 2019, 13:30
RSM Place
11 King Street West, Suite 700
Toronto, Ontario
Canada,

Chair: Trustee

CERTIFICATE OF APPOINTMENT - Section 49 of the Act; Rule 85

-- AMENDED --

I, the undersigned, official receiver in and for this bankruptcy district, do hereby certify that:

- the aforenamed debtor filed an assignment under section 49 of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act;
- the aforenamed trustee was duly appointed trustee of the estate of the debtor.

The said trustee is required:
- to provide to me, without delay, security in the aforementioned amount;
- to send to all creditors, within five days after the date of the trustee's appointment, a notice of the bankruptcy;

and
- when applicable, to call in the prescribed manner a first meeting of creditors, to be held at the

aforementioned time and place or at any other time and place that may be later requested by the official
receiver.

Date: February 20, 2020, 08:37
E-File/Dépôt Electronique Official Receiver

Federal Building - Hamilton, 55 Bay Street N, 9th Floor, Hamilton, Ontario, Canada, L8R3P7, (877)376-9902



 

 

 

 

 

APPENDIX K 



Receipts

Collections - New Sales 576,368$             

Collections - Accounts Receivable 705,109               

Transfers from other banks 37,793                 

Sale of assets 565,182               

Funding from Secured Lender 50,000                 

Petty cash, miscellaneous refunds and interest earned 15,916                 

Total receipts 1,950,367$          

Disbursements

Payroll and consulting fees 151,840$             

Rent 80,852                 

Payroll taxes/WSIB/WCB 56,496                 

Packaging & Freight 39,720                 

Credit card processing fees 28,050                 

GST/HST/PST/QST paid 76,111                 

Lock change/advertising/travel/interest/other 24,750                 

Temporary Workers 9,295                   

Critical Suppliers/IT Services 9,566                   

Insurance 8,243                   

Utilities 8,581                   

Payroll processing fees 241                     

Deemed trust 315                     

Receiver's fees and costs 312,374               

Legal Fees 57,968                 

Total Disbursements 864,402$             

Excess receipts over disbursments 1,085,965$          

Repayment/payment to secured lender (821,900)             

Transfer to bankruptcy trustee (160,000)             

Cash on hand 104,065$             

This appendix forms part of the Fourth Report of the Receiver of Amax Health Inc. and

should be reviewed in conjunction with the Fourth Report.

In the Matter of the Receivership of Amax Health Inc.

Receiver's Interim Statement of Receipts and Disbursements

For the Period June 4, 2019 to June 8, 2020



 

 

 

 

 

APPENDIX L 



Court File No. 19-69485 

 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 
 
 
 

BETWEEN: 

CANADIAN IMPERIAL BANK OF COMMERCE 

Applicant 

-and- 

AMAX HEALTH INC. 

Respondent 

 
AFFIDAVIT OF ARIF DHANANI 

(Sworn June 8, 2020)  

 

I, ARIF DHANANI, of the City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario, MAKE 

OATH AND SAY AS FOLLOWS: 

1. I am a Vice-President of RSM Canada Limited (“RSM”), the Court-appointed 

receiver in these proceedings (the “Receiver”).  As such, I have personal knowledge of 

the matters to which I hereinafter depose, save and except those matters based upon 

information and belief, in which case I have stated the source of such facts, all of which I 

verily believe to be true. 

2. Pursuant to the Order of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial 

List) dated June 4, 2019, RSM was appointed as receiver, without security, of all of the 

assets, undertakings and properties of Amax Health Inc. (“Amax”) acquired for, or used 







RSM CANADA LIMITED 
Licensed Insolvency Trustee 
11 King St W, Suite 700, Box 27 
Toronto, ON M5H 4C7  
 
T +1 416 480 0160 
F +1 416 480 2646 
 
www.rsmcanada.com  

GST/HST: 80784 1440 RT 0001 

 

To RSM Canada Limited 
 Court-appointed Receiver of 
 Amax Health Inc. 
 11 King Street West, Suite 700 
 Toronto, ON  M5H 4C7 
  

Date March 4, 2020 
  

Client File 786-788-3 
Invoice 4 

No. 5916579 
 

 
For professional services rendered with respect to the appointment of RSM Canada Limited as Court-
appointed Receiver of Amax Health Inc. for the period October 1, 2019 to December 31, 2019. 
 

 
Date Professional Description 

10/01/2019 Arif Dhanani Review of email from B. Wong re Canada Revenue Agency (“CRA”) and 
respond thereto; review voicemail from CRA re Amax Dental Supply BC Inc. 
and return call to CRA; emails from/to CIBC re payout value; review Third 
Report of the Receiver and comment thereon. 

10/01/2019 Brenda Wong Send fax to Deluxe re required corrections for T4s; prepare memo re results of 
CRA trust exam; call from Service Canada; emails with Moneris re partial 
release of holdback and prepare paperwork for processing of Moneris credits 
and debit; discussion with C. Noble of CRA re outstanding HST returns and 
refunds due to the Receiver; review invoice for payment. 

10/01/2019 Usama Emad Review memo from B. Wong regarding CRA trust exam. 
10/02/2019 Jeff Berger Edit the Receiver's Third Report and discuss same with B. Wong and 

A. Dhanani. 
10/02/2019 Arif Dhanani Discussion with J. Berger re Third Report and R&D to September 30, 2019. 
10/02/2019 Brenda Wong Review correspondence received; review and update draft report re Moneris 

holdback; prepare final WSIB return; review Enbridge bill and past payments to 
Enbridge. 

10/02/2019 Usama Emad Contact Enbridge to obtain final invoice and discuss payment of same with 
B. Wong. 

10/03/2019 Arif Dhanani Call with C. Yamashita of Scarfone Hawkins LLP re email from M. Valente re 
Ministry of Finance deemed trust. 

10/03/2019 Anne Baptiste Prepare disbursement cheques; filing re banking; process receipts; processing 
GIC purchase. 

10/04/2019 Jeff Berger Call with J. Davies re affidavit of fees required by the Receiver. 
10/04/2019 Daniel Weisz Review and sign cheques, review and sign form required by CIBC. 
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Date Professional Description 

10/04/2019 Brenda Wong Review and sign disbursement cheques; call to Enbridge to request support for 
outstanding account, obtain copies of outstanding invoices and follow up with 
A. Dhanani re missing cheque; call from creditor inquiring re status; call from 
Worksafe BC inquiring re payment received. 

10/06/2019 Jeff Berger Revise and finalize the Receiver's Third Report. 
10/07/2019 Jeff Berger Receipt and review of email from collection agent re settlement offers on 

outstanding balances; respond to same re Receiver's approval of settlements. 
10/07/2019 Arif Dhanani Emails to/from CIBC re addition of legal fees to CIBC payout; call with 

M. Valente and C. Yamashita re provincial sales tax amounts and priority. 
10/07/2019 Brenda Wong Send completed Form 10900 to CIBC Business Centre. 
10/08/2019 Arif Dhanani Review of Receiver's Third Report, review Receiver's R&D to September 30, 

2019 amend both and send report to counsel; emails to/from CIBC re payout 
amounts; facilitate execution of articles of amendment for Amax pursuant to 
asset purchase agreement and send same to counsel; emails from/to 
unsecured creditor requesting payment for overdue amounts. 

10/08/2019 Brenda Wong Call to Deluxe to inquire re status of T4s to be issued; respond to inquiry from 
creditor. 

10/09/2019 Brenda Wong Calculate pre- versus post-receivership payroll for purposes of reviewing T4s 
prepared by Deluxe; call to Deluxe to request password for T4 Audit document 
sent. 

10/09/2019 Anne Baptiste Prepare disbursement cheques. 
10/10/2019 Arif Dhanani Review changes made by counsel to Receiver's Third Report and accept 

same, as appropriate; forward Third Report to D. Weisz for final comments. 
10/10/2019 Daniel Weisz Review and update report to court. 
10/11/2019 Jeff Berger Review report comments from D. Weisz and incorporate same, as appropriate. 
10/11/2019 Brenda Wong Review revised RP0001 T4 totals. 
10/15/2019 Brenda Wong Review 2019 T4 Audit report and send fax to Deluxe re correction required; 

call from and email to employee re WEPP information not received; review BC 
Ministry of Finance NOA re PST remitted for June and July 2019; review 
correspondence received and respond to letter from creditor. 

10/16/2019 Arif Dhanani Finalize Third Report and send to counsel; draft fee affidavit and summary 
thereto; attend to receivership administration; assemble appendices and send 
to counsel; discussion with B. Tannenbaum re signing report; attend to various 
calls from creditors. 

10/16/2019 Daniel Weisz Review files and attend to receivership administration. 
10/16/2019 Brenda Wong Call to Ministry of Revenu Quebec re QPIP. 
10/17/2019 Anne Baptiste Prepare disbursement cheques and mail same; prepare bank reconciliation. 
10/18/2019 Brenda Wong Review correspondence from CRA and WCB Alberta; draft letter to WCB to 

advise of stay of proceedings; review creditor correspondence. 
10/21/2019 Arif Dhanani Facilitate posting of Receiver's Third Report and Motion Record on Receiver's 

website. 
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Date Professional Description 

10/21/2019 Brenda Wong Call to Revenu Quebec re remitting QST, review QST liability calculation, draft 
letter to Revenu Quebec; review correspondence, call and email to ADT to 
notify of receivership and request cancellation of account. 

10/21/2019 Usama Emad Correspond with collection agency on potential customer payments, approval 
on partial balance collections and organize all payment support provided by 
collection agent; discuss HST return analysis with B. Wong. 

10/22/2019 Brenda Wong Respond to email and call from trade creditors inquiring re payment or 
requesting an update; review email from Deluxe with revised 2019 T4s, review 
changes and email to Deluxe to approve. 

10/22/2019 Usama Emad Servus credit union documents with B. Wong to finalize; correspond with 
accounts receivable collection agent on partial payment of customer accounts 
and coordinate a meeting with representative to obtain collections proceeds 
cheque. 

10/23/2019 Brenda Wong Review and execute Servus membership closing form; complete form FIN 357 
and email to BC Ministry of Finance to close the Receiver's PST account; 
review CIBC online statement for October activity; emails with Deluxe re 
payment and process for final T4s and closing of account; review Deluxe 
online account for additional reports to be downloaded; review email from ADT 
and call to respond; call from trade creditor inquiring re status. 

10/23/2019 Usama Emad Meet with collection agent to discuss status on the outstanding accounts and 
to obtain cheque; facilitate bank deposit of accounts receivable collections; 
submit the signed Servus account closure forms; return Cogeco modem. 

10/24/2019 Usama Emad Call with unsecured creditor re address update. 
10/25/2019 Arif Dhanani Reconcile Receiver's R&D to October 25, 2019; calculate CIBC payout amount 

as at November 1, 2019; draft schedule of proposed distributions and 
holdbacks from cash balance for bankruptcy purposes and send same to 
B. Wong for comment. 

10/25/2019 Brenda Wong Review correspondence from WSIB and review status, email to WSIB to close 
account; respond to email from creditor; review and update creditors list; 
review draft R&D and calculation of funds available for distribution. 

10/28/2019 Arif Dhanani Review email from B. Wong with comments on distribution and holdback 
amounts and respond thereto, including updating schedule and Receiver's 
R&D for accounts receivable collected, but not reflected in Receiver's G/L. 

10/28/2019 Brenda Wong Updating creditors list and review forms for bankruptcy filing; calls to Telus re 
outstanding charges and obtaining copies online of outstanding bills; call to 
MetCredit re Telus account sent for collection; review Telus invoices for 
charges to be paid by the Receiver; review of draft R&D. 

10/28/2019 Usama Emad Review of disbursements and summarize final payments to utility providers, 
including Enbridge, Alectra, Enmax, Bell and Telus; discuss same with 
B. Wong and J. Berger and provide copy of updated utility and services 
tracking spreadsheet; obtain outstanding invoices for various Telus accounts, 
summarize amounts owed by the Receiver and prepare cheque request for 
B. Wong to review; provide update on other expenses outstanding. 

10/28/2019 Anne Baptiste Process receipts; prepare disbursement cheques; filing re banking. 
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10/29/2019 Arif Dhanani Emails to/from B. Tucci at CIBC to confirm November 1, 2019 payout number; 
complete cheque requisition for processing of cheque for CIBC; attend to 
receivership administration. 

10/30/2019 Jeff Berger Review letter to the BC Ministry of Finance and provide comments on same. 
10/30/2019 Arif Dhanani Review of correspondence from BC Ministry of Finance and draft letter to 

same, send letter to counsel for comments prior to release of same; finalize 
letter and assemble fax to BC Ministry of Finance. 

10/30/2019 Brenda Wong Emails to CIBC to request redemption of GIC and confirmation of receipt and 
prepare letter of direction; review Telus bills provided for remaining account, 
prepare cheque requisitions for payment and respond to email from MetCredit 
re Telus account; email to Telus re charges to be paid by the Receiver. 

10/31/2019 Brenda Wong Check online statement to confirm redemption of GIC. 
11/01/2019 Arif Dhanani Emails to/from CIBC re payout cheque; meet with B. Tucci to provide him with 

payout cheque; facilitate payment of Scarfone Hawkins LLP and Sarna 
Neudorfer legal invoices. 

11/01/2019 Bryan Tannenbaum Review and approve cheques. 
11/01/2019 Brenda Wong Send email to Moneris to inquire re funds released on October 31 and balance 

of funds held by Moneris; review correspondence from Enmax and 
Metropolitan Credit Adjusters; review G/L and prior correspondence and call to 
WorkSafe BC to inquire as to balance owing. 

11/01/2019 Usama Emad Call with CRA regarding the outstanding returns and Amax refund status. 
11/01/2019 Anne Baptiste Prepare disbursement cheques; process receipts. 
11/04/2019 Brenda Wong Submit CIBC wire transfer request for payment to Deluxe for preparation of 

final T4s and email to D. Weisz to request approval of wire transfer; review 
October online statement for Moneris settlements to be posted; prepare cover 
letter to Telus re partial payment of outstanding accounts; arrange for transfer 
of surplus funds to bankruptcy estate. 

11/05/2019 Brenda Wong Email to Arthur J. Gallagher to follow up on partial refund of annual premium 
paid by the Receiver. 

11/05/2019 Usama Emad Contact Cogeco to provide tracking information on the hardware that was 
mailed back at the end of October 2019; provide final invoice and the amount 
of payment that will be processed. 

11/06/2019 Arif Dhanani Review of email from B. Wong re Moneris and reply thereto. 
11/06/2019 Brenda Wong Follow up with Moneris re release of funds held as reserve; respond to creditor 

correspondence re unpaid bills for service provided after June 4. 
11/07/2019 Anne Baptiste Filing re banking; process receipts, deposits; prepare disbursement cheques. 
11/11/2019 Brenda Wong Review employee emails re WEPP claim; emails with Moneris to arrange for 

pick-up of terminal. 
11/13/2019 Brenda Wong Review outstanding issues re employee claim, calculate amount of revised 

claim, prepare revised proof of claim and send response. 
11/13/2019 Usama Emad Review WEPP support, including credit card statement for expense claim of 

employee and discuss same with B. Wong. 
11/14/2019 Anne Baptiste Filing re banking; prepare disbursement cheques; prepare bank reconciliation. 
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Date Professional Description 

11/15/2019 Brenda Wong Call from former employee re her WEPP claim. 
11/22/2019 Arif Dhanani Draft and send follow up letter to BC Ministry of Finance re lien; call with WSIB 

re notice of non-reporting for 3rd quarter of 2019, clear up misunderstanding 
on WSIB's end re mistakenly opening of 2 accounts; call with BC Ministry of 
Finance. 

11/22/2019 Anne Baptiste Filing re banking; prepare bank reconciliation; prepare disbursement cheques; 
process term deposit. 

11/26/2019 Brenda Wong Respond to employee inquiry re WEPP and proof of claim; review Deluxe T4 
information received. 

11/29/2019 Anne Baptiste Filing re banking. 
12/03/2019 Brenda Wong Check online statement for receipt of Moneris reserve and send email to 

Moneris to request payment of November installment immediately; review 
employee proof of claim and submit employee information to WEPP. 

12/09/2019 Brenda Wong Check online banking for release of funds by Moneris; email to Moneris to 
follow up on release of November 30 payment. 

12/10/2019 Brenda Wong Check online banking to confirm receipt of Moneris payment; arrange for 
transfer of surplus funds to bankruptcy estate. 

12/18/2019 Brenda Wong Review payroll reports for information required to complete the Revenue 
Quebec RL-1 Summary and call to Deluxe to inquire re information required. 

12/20/2019 Brenda Wong Call from creditor inquiring re new company operating as Amax. 
  To all other administrative matters with respect to this engagement, including 

supervision, all meetings, telephone attendances, and written and verbal 
correspondence to facilitate the foregoing. 
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FEE SUMMARY 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
VISA/MASTERCARD 
Payments can be made by calling the Accounts Receivable Department at 647.726.0483. 
 
WIRE PAYMENT DETAILS 
Please contact Donna Nishimura at 647.727.3552 for wire instructions. 
 
 

Invoices are due upon receipt. 
RSM Canada Limited 

Professional Level Hours Rate Fees
Bryan A. Tannenbaum, FCPA, FCA, FCIRP, LIT President 0.1 550$     55.00$           
Daniel R. Weisz, CPA, CA, CFF, CIRP, LIT Senior Vice President 2.7 525$     1,417.50        
Arif N. Dhanani, CPA, CA, CIRP, LIT Vice President 18.9 395$     7,465.50        
Brenda Wong, CIRP, LIT Senior Manager 18.6 395$     7,347.00        
Jeffrey K. Berger, CPA, CA Manager 4.8 295$     1,416.00        
Usama Emad, CPA Senior Associate 6.0 195$     1,170.00        
Anne Baptiste Estate Administrator 5.0 110$     550.00           
Total hours and professional fees 56.1 19,421.00$    
Disbursements
     Postage 54.81$       
     Courier 27.62         
Total disbursements 82.43             
Total professional fees and disbursements 19,503.43$    
HST @ 13% 2,535.45        
Total payable 22,038.88$ 



RSM CANADA LIMITED 
Licensed Insolvency Trustee 
11 King St W, Suite 700, Box 27 
Toronto, ON M5H 4C7  
 
T +1 416 480 0160 
F +1 416 480 2646 
 
www.rsmcanada.com  

GST/HST: 80784 1440 RT 0001 

 

To RSM Canada Limited 
 Court-appointed Receiver of 
 Amax Health Inc. 
 11 King Street West, Suite 700 
 Toronto, ON  M5H 4C7 
  

Date March 4, 2020 
  

Client File 786-788-3 
Invoice 5 

No. 5916640 
 

 
For professional services rendered with respect to the appointment of RSM Canada Limited as Court-
appointed Receiver of Amax Health Inc. for the period January 1, 2020 to January 31, 2020. 
 

 
Date Professional Description 

01/02/2020 Brenda Wong Check online banking re December 31 payment due from Moneris and follow 
up with Moneris re when the payment will be released. 

01/03/2020 Brenda Wong Finalize RL-1 Summary and send to Revenu Quebec. 
01/10/2020 Anne Baptiste Prepare bank reconciliation; filing re banking. 
01/13/2020 Brenda Wong Check online banking to confirm receipt of Moneris payment and email to 

Moneris to request timely payment of the final instalment due January 31. 
01/14/2020 Arif Dhanani Emails from/to B. Wong re remaining liabilities of the Receiver and S. 246(2) 

report to be completed and submitted to the OSB. 
01/14/2020 Brenda Wong Prepare S. 246(2) Interim Report and draft statement of receipts and 

disbursements. 
01/15/2020 Brenda Wong Call to Ensign Electronic Alarm Systems to inquire re outstanding cheque. 
01/17/2020 Anne Baptiste Prepare bank reconciliation; filing re banking; process receipt. 
01/22/2020 Donna Nishimura Prepare deposit slip and deposit cheques at the bank. 
01/24/2020 Brenda Wong Begin drafting Fourth Report to Court. 
01/24/2020 Anne Baptiste Filing re banking; prepare disbursement cheques; processing term deposit. 
01/27/2020 Brenda Wong Review CGC collection reports and status of collections. 
01/28/2020 Brenda Wong Continue drafting Fourth Report to Court. 
01/31/2020 Arif Dhanani Review of various correspondence received from WorkSafe BC and WSIB and 

discuss same with B. Wong. 
01/31/2020 Brenda Wong Review correspondence from WorkSafe BC, call to WorkSafe BC to inquire re 

two returns received, prepare 2019 annual return. 
01/31/2020 Anne Baptiste Filing re banking. 



March 4, 2020 
Invoice 5 
Page 2 

Date Professional Description 

  To all other administrative matters with respect to this engagement, including 
supervision, all meetings, telephone attendances, and written and verbal 
correspondence to facilitate the foregoing. 

 
 
 
 
 

FEE SUMMARY 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
VISA/MASTERCARD 
Payments can be made by calling the Accounts Receivable Department at 647.726.0483. 
 
WIRE PAYMENT DETAILS 
Please contact Donna Nishimura at 647.727.3552 for wire instructions. 
 
 

Invoices are due upon receipt. 
RSM Canada Limited 

Professional Level Hours Rate Fees
Arif N. Dhanani, CPA, CA, CIRP, LIT Vice President 0.6 395$     237.00           
Brenda Wong, CIRP, LIT Senior Manager 4.7 395$     1,856.50        
Anne Baptiste/Donna Nishimura Estate Administrator 1.4 110$     154.00           
Total hours and professional fees 6.7 2,247.50$      
HST @ 13% 292.18           
Total payable 2,539.68$    



RSM CANADA LIMITED 
Licensed Insolvency Trustee 
11 King St W, Suite 700, Box 27 
Toronto, ON M5H 4C7  
 
T +1 416 480 0160 
F +1 416 480 2646 
 
www.rsmcanada.com  

GST/HST: 80784 1440 RT 0001 

 

To RSM Canada Limited 
 Court-appointed Receiver of 
 Amax Health Inc. 
 11 King Street West, Suite 700 
 Toronto, ON  M5H 4C7 
  

Date March 4, 2020 
  

Client File 786-788-3 
Invoice 6 

No. 5916651 
 

 
For professional services rendered with respect to the appointment of RSM Canada Limited as Court-
appointed Receiver of Amax Health Inc. for the period February 1, 2020 to February 29, 2020. 
 

 
Date Professional Description 

02/03/2020 Brenda Wong Check online statement for final payment from Moneris and follow up with 
Moneris re its late payment. 

02/07/2020 Brenda Wong Check online banking for Moneris payment. 
02/10/2020 Donna Nishimura Deposit cheque at the bank. 
02/14/2020 Brenda Wong Review status of HST returns filed and reconcile July 31, 2019 filed return to 

supporting reports. 
02/18/2020 Brenda Wong Prepare and file HST returns for August 1, 2019 to January 31, 2020; calculate 

HST, GST and PST on bad debt recoveries. 
02/19/2020 Donna Nishimura Deposit cheque at the bank. 
02/19/2020 Brenda Wong Prepare RC342 and fax to Canada Revenue Agency (“CRA”); review creditor 

correspondence and call to creditor re same. 
02/21/2020 Brenda Wong Respond to creditor inquiry re Amax's operations; updating the Receiver's 

webpage; discussion with CRA re outstanding corporate tax and HST returns. 
02/21/2020 Anne Baptiste Filing re banking; process receipt. 
02/24/2020 Brenda Wong Prepare revised RC342 forms and fax to CRA. 
02/25/2020 Brenda Wong File nil HST returns for outstanding pre-receivership returns. 
  To all other administrative matters with respect to this engagement, including 

supervision, all meetings, telephone attendances, and written and verbal 
correspondence to facilitate the foregoing. 
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FEE SUMMARY 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
VISA/MASTERCARD 
Payments can be made by calling the Accounts Receivable Department at 647.726.0483. 
 
WIRE PAYMENT DETAILS 
Please contact Donna Nishimura at 647.727.3552 for wire instructions. 
 
 

Invoices are due upon receipt. 
RSM Canada Limited 

Professional Level Hours Rate Fees
Brenda Wong, CIRP, LIT Senior Manager 4.1 395$     1,619.50$      
Anne Baptiste/Donna Nishimura Estate Administrator 0.3 110$     33.00             
Total hours and professional fees 4.4 1,652.50$      
HST @ 13% 214.83           
Total payable 1,867.33$    



RSM CANADA LIMITED 
Licensed Insolvency Trustee 
11 King St W, Suite 700, Box 27 
Toronto, ON M5H 4C7  
 
T +1 416 480 0160 
F +1 416 480 2646 
 
www.rsmcanada.com  

GST/HST: 80784 1440 RT 0001 

 

To RSM Canada Limited 
 Court-appointed Receiver of 
 Amax Health Inc. 
 11 King Street West, Suite 700 
 Toronto, ON  M5H 4C7 
  

Date April 27, 2020 
  

Client File 7867883 
Invoice 7 

No. 5991834 
 

 
For professional services rendered with respect to the appointment of RSM Canada Limited as Court-
appointed Receiver of Amax Health Inc. for the period March 1, 2020 to March 31, 2020. 
 

 
Date Professional Description 

03/02/2020 Brenda Wong Call to Jasper Avenue Dental re unidentified cheque received; review 
correspondence re new service contract and email to sender to advise of 
Amax's bankruptcy; send follow up email to Bell re closure of account. 

03/02/2020 Arif Dhanani Call with M. Valente at Scarfone Hawkins LLP (“Scarfone Hawkins”) on next 
report to Court and discharge of Receiver; draft portions of Receiver's Fourth 
Report; reconcile Receiver's statement of receipts and disbursements to 
March 2, 2020. 

03/03/2020 Brenda Wong Updating the Receiver's draft report with respect to outstanding HST filings 
and corporate tax returns. 

03/03/2020 Brenda Wong Call from former employee re monies owed by Amax and request for T2200 
form, send information on the WEPP to employee. 

03/03/2020 Arif Dhanani Finalize draft of Receiver's Fourth Report and send to D. Weisz for comments. 
03/04/2020 Daniel Weisz Review and update report to court. 
03/04/2020 Arif Dhanani Review comments on Fourth Report from D. Weisz and incorporate same, as 

appropriate. 
03/06/2020 Anne Baptiste Prepare disbursement cheque; filing re banking. 
03/06/2020 Brenda Wong Update report; follow up re A/R payment received and deposited in February 

2020; email to Collection Group to request update. 
03/09/2020 Brenda Wong Follow up with asset purchaser to inquire about cheque received. 
03/11/2020 Arif Dhanani Finalize draft of Receiver's Fourth Report and send same to Scarfone Hawkins 

for comments. 
03/13/2020 Anne Baptiste Prepare disbursement cheque; filing re banking. 
03/13/2020 Brenda Wong Return call from Dominique Laroche Dentiste re A/R cheque sent in error to 

Receiver. 
03/17/2020 Bryan Tannenbaum Receipt and review of BC PPSA from Scarfone Hawkins. 
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Date Professional Description 

03/23/2020 Brenda Wong Follow up with asset purchaser re two cheques received by the Receiver. 
  To all other administrative matters with respect to this engagement, including 

supervision, all meetings, telephone attendances, and written and verbal 
correspondence to facilitate the foregoing. 

 
 
 
 
 

FEE SUMMARY 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
VISA/MASTERCARD 
Payments can be made by calling the Accounts Receivable Department at 647.726.0483. 
 
WIRE PAYMENT DETAILS 
Please contact Donna Nishimura at 647.727.3552 for wire instructions. 
 
 

Invoices are due upon receipt. 
RSM Canada Limited 

Professional Level Hours Rate Fees
Bryan A. Tannenbaum, FCPA, FCA, FCIRP, LIT President 0.1 550$     55.00$            
Daniel R. Weisz, CPA, CA, CFF, CIRP, LIT Senior Vice President 2.2 525$     1,155.00         
Arif N. Dhanani, CPA, CA, CIRP, LIT Vice President 6.8 395$     2,686.00         
Brenda Wong, CIRP, LIT Senior Manager 1.7 395$     671.50            
Anne Baptiste Estate Administrator 0.4 110$     44.00              
Total hours and professional fees 11.2 4,611.50$       
HST @ 13% 599.50            
Total payable 5,211.00$       



RSM CANADA LIMITED 
Licensed Insolvency Trustee 
11 King St W, Suite 700, Box 27 
Toronto, ON M5H 4C7  
 
T +1 416 480 0160 
F +1 416 480 2646 
 
www.rsmcanada.com  

GST/HST: 80784 1440 RT 0001 

 

To RSM Canada Limited 
 Court-appointed Receiver of 
 Amax Health Inc. 
 11 King Street West, Suite 700 
 Toronto, ON  M5H 4C7 
  

Date June 2, 2020 
  

Client File 7867883 
Invoice 8 

No. 6028399 
 

 
For professional services rendered with respect to the appointment of RSM Canada Limited as Court-
appointed Receiver of Amax Health Inc. for the period April 1, 2020 to May 31, 2020. 
 

 
Date Professional Description 

04/03/2020 Arif Dhanani Email exchange with counsel re discharge hearing and timing of same. 
04/06/2020 Arif Dhanani Review of email from M. Valente of Scarfone Hawkins LLP re delay in hearing 

of Receiver's discharge motion. 
04/06/2020 Brenda Wong Emails from former employee enquiring about T2200 form. 
04/13/2020 Brenda Wong Prepare transfer form, fax and email to CIBC to request wire transfer; respond 

to email from GS Medical Packaging re cheques for the new Amax that were 
sent to the Receiver. 

04/20/2020 Brenda Wong Follow up with the purchaser re 3 cheques received for Amax A/R. 
04/21/2020 Brenda Wong Emails with GS Medical Packaging re Amax cheques received by the 

Receiver. 
04/22/2020 Anne Baptiste Prepare bank reconciliation. 
04/24/2020 Brenda Wong Review email from GS Medical Packaging and arrange for cheques received 

by the Receiver to be mailed to them. 
04/29/2020 Daniel Weisz Review and approve wire request. 
04/30/2020 Brenda Wong Call from CIBC re wire transfer request. 
05/12/2020 Anne Baptiste Prepare bank reconciliation. 
05/15/2020 Brenda Wong Review emails from Canada Post re expiry of mail redirections and follow up re 

whether an extension is required. 
05/19/2020 Brenda Wong Review and respond to email from J. Berger re mail redirection. 
05/19/2020 Echa Odeh Calculate and file HST return; email to Worksafe NB to cancel account. 
05/20/2020 Jeff Berger Call and email Bell Canada re invoice received for outstanding charges on 

account. 
05/29/2020 Arif Dhanani Review Receiver's Fourth Report and update same to end of May 2020; 

update Receiver's statement of receipts and disbursements; review and 
update Receiver's fee affidavit. 
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Date Professional Description 

  To all other administrative matters with respect to this engagement, including 
supervision, all meetings, telephone attendances, and written and verbal 
correspondence to facilitate the foregoing. 

 
 
 

FEE SUMMARY 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
VISA/MASTERCARD 
Payments can be made by calling the Accounts Receivable Department at 647.726.0483. 
 
WIRE PAYMENT DETAILS 
Please contact Donna Nishimura at 647.727.3552 for wire instructions. 
 
 

Invoices are due upon receipt. 
RSM Canada Limited 

Professional Level Hours Rate Fees
Daniel R. Weisz, CPA, CA, CFF, CIRP, LIT Senior Vice President 0.1 525$     52.50$            
Arif N. Dhanani, CPA, CA, CIRP, LIT Vice President 0.4 395$     158.00            
Brenda Wong, CIRP, LIT Senior Manager 0.9 395$     355.50            
Anne Baptiste Estate Administrator 0.3 110$     33.00              
Subtotal hours and professional fees 1.7 599.00$          

Professional Level Hours Rate Fees
Arif N. Dhanani, CPA, CA, CIRP, LIT Vice President 1.6 485$     776.00$          
Brenda Wong, CIRP, LIT Senior Manager 0.2 485$     97.00              
Jeffrey K. Berger, CPA, CA, CIRP Manager 0.5 395$     197.50            
Echa Odeh Senior Associate 0.7 225$     157.50            
Anne Baptiste Estate Administrator 0.3 110$     33.00              
Subtotal hours and professional fees 3.3 1,261.00$       

Total Hours and Professional Fees 5.0     1,860.00$       
HST @ 13% 241.80            
Total Payable 2,101.80$       

* New rates are effective May 1, 2020 with RSM Canada Limited's new fiscal year.

April - Fee Summary

May - Fee Summary*



RSM CANADA LIMITED 
Licensed Insolvency Trustee 
11 King St W, Suite 700, Box 27 
Toronto, ON M5H 4C7  
 
T +1 416 480 0160 
F +1 416 480 2646 
 
www.rsmcanada.com  

GST/HST: 80784 1440 RT 0001 

 

To RSM Canada Limited 

 Court-appointed Receiver of 

 Amax Health Inc. 

 11 King Street West, Suite 700 

 Toronto, ON  M5H 4C7 

  

Date June 4, 2020 

  

Client File 7867883 

Invoice 9 

No.  

 
 
For professional services rendered with respect to the appointment of RSM Canada Limited as Court-
appointed Receiver of Amax Health Inc. 
 

 
 
 
 

Estimate to attend to all other administrative matters with 
respect to this engagement, including supervision, all 
meetings, telephone attendances, and written and verbal 
correspondence to complete the receivership administration. 
 

 
 
 

$15,000.00 

HST @ 13% 
 

  1,950.00 

Total Payable 
 

$16,950.00 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
VISA/MASTERCARD 
Payments can be made by calling the Accounts Receivable Department at 647.726.0483. 
 
WIRE PAYMENT DETAILS 
Please contact Donna Nishimura at 647.727.3552 for wire instructions. 
 
 

Invoices are due upon receipt. 

RSM Canada Limited 





Invoice No. Billing Period Total Fees Disbursements HST Hours 
Average 

Hourly Rate
Total

4
October 1 to 
December 31, 
2019

 $    19,421.00  $                   82.43  $    2,535.45        56.10  $       346.19  $    22,038.88 

5
January 1 to 31, 
2020

         2,247.50                            -             292.18          6.70  $       335.45          2,539.68 

6
February 1 to 29, 
2020

         1,652.50                            -             214.83          4.40  $       375.57          1,867.33 

7
March 1 to 31, 
2020

         4,611.50                            -             599.50        11.20  $       411.74          5,211.00 

8
April 1 to May 31, 
2020

         1,860.00                            -             241.80          5.00  $       372.00          2,101.80 

Total fees to    

May 31, 2020
 $    29,792.50  $                   82.43  $    3,883.74        83.40  $       357.22  $    33,758.67 

9
Estimated to 

completion
       15,000.00                            -          1,950.00        38.00           394.74  $    16,950.00 

Total fees  $    44,792.50  $                   82.43  $    5,833.74      121.40  $       368.97  $    50,708.67 

EXHIBIT "B"

Calculation of Average Hourly Billing Rates of

RSM Canada Limited

for the Period October 1, 2019 to May 31, 2020 and Estimate to Complete Administration



 

 

 

 

 

APPENDIX M 



Court File No. 19-69485 
ONTARIO 

SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

B E T W E E N: 

CANADIAN IMPERIAL BANK OF COMMERCE 
Applicant 

and 

AMAX HEALTH INC. 
Respondent 

AFFIDAVIT OF KAUSH PARAMESWARAN 

I, Kaush Parameswaran, of the city of Hamilton, Province of Ontario, MAKE OATH 

AND SAY: 

1. I am an associate lawyer with the law firm of Scarfone Hawkins LLP, lawyers to

RSM Canada Limited (the “Receiver”), in its capacity as Court appointed receiver of 

Amax Health Inc. (“Amax”) and as such, I have knowledge of the matters to which I 

hereinafter depose. 

2. Our firm was retained to act as counsel to the Receiver on or about June 5, 2019.

3. In connection with acting as counsel to the Receiver, a total of $17,487.54 inclusive

of disbursements and HST was charged by Scarfone Hawkins LLP for the period 

commencing October 1, 2019 to May 29, 2020, inclusive (the “Activity Period”).  

Attached as collective Exhibit “A” are true copies of Scarfone Hawkins LLP account 

dated December 31, 2019 and its account dated May 29, 2020 (the “Accounts”). 

4. The Accounts are a fair and accurate description of the services provided to the

Receiver, the disbursements incurred and the amounts charged by Scarfone Hawkins 



LLP. Copies of the Accounts have been provided to the Receiver. I am advised by the 

Receiver that they have reviewed the Accounts and consider the fees and disbursements 

to be fair and reasonable. 

5. I verily believe that the rates charged by Scarfone Hawkins LLP in connection with

acting as counsel to the Receiver are comparable to the rates charged by other law firms 

in the Hamilton market for the provision of similar services. 

6. The hourly billing rates as set out in the Accounts are the same hourly rates

charged by Scarfone Hawkins LLP for services rendered to clients in relation to similar 

proceedings. 

7. Attached as Exhibit "B" is a schedule summarizing the Accounts including the

total billable hours charged, the total fees charged and the average hourly rate charged. 

Our firm expended a total of 8.5 hours in connection with this matter for the Activity Period. 

8. Based on my review of this matter and experience with matters of this nature, I

verily believe that Scarfone Hawkins LLP will incur additional fees and disbursements 

of $5,320.00 plus applicable HST to bring this matter to a completion. 

9. I make this affidavit solely in support of an order approving the fees and

disbursements of counsel for the Receiver and for no improper purpose. 

SWORN BEFORE ME at the 
City of Hamilton, in the 
Province of Ontario 8 day of 
June, 2020 

�� 
Commissioner/or Taking A[(id01·i1s 

(or as may he) 

/t!lc..hl'lc�i /Pt /�;,/-e-

KAUSHPARAMESWARAN 



This is Exhibit “A - B” referred to in the Affidavit of  

Kaush Parameswaran, sworn June 8, 2020 by way of 

remote video conferencing. 

. 

Commissioner for Taking Affidavits (or as may be) 



Exhibit "A"













 Account payable upon receipt.  In accordance with the Section 33 of the Solicitors Act, interest will be charged at the annual rate stated 
 calculated from 30 days after delivery of this account.  A receipted account will not be mailed unless requested by you

4.00%Interest Rate Account Payable upon receipt.  In accordance with the Section 33 of the Solicitors Act, interest will be charged at the annual rate stated calculated from 30 days after delivery of this account.  A receipted account will not be mailed unless requested by you.

 LAWYERS AND TRADE-MARK AGENTS
 IN ACCOUNT WITH

 TELEFAX

 TELEPHONE

 162600

 INVOICE  NUMBER:

 DATE:

 11 KING STREET WEST
 SUITE 700, BOX 27
 TORONTO, ONTARIO
 M5C 4C7 CANADA

 May 29, 2020

 OUR FILE NO.:

 19L0200

 873984314 RT - 0001

 RE:  AMAX HEALTH INC., RECEIVERSHIP

 RSM CANADA LIMITED

 H.S.T. REGISTRATION NO.

 Scarfone Hawkins LLP

 ONE JAMES STREET SOUTH
 14TH FLOOR

 P.O. BOX 926, DEPOT #1
 HAMILTON, ONTARIO

 L8N 3P9

 ARIF DHANANI, VICE PRESIDENT

 905-523-1333

 905-523-5878

 May 29/20 services rendered in connection with the above-noted matter to TO ALL PROFESSIONAL

 DESCRIPTION HOURS TIMEKEEPER DATE

 02 /03/20  MJV  0.10  Emails from and to RSM; 

 02 /27/20  MJV  0.10  Email to A. Dhanani; 

 03 /02/20  MJV  0.30  Emails from and to and telephone attendance with 
 A. Dhanani discussing issues at hand;

 03 /12/20  MJV  0.50  Receiving and reviewing draft Fourth Report;
 instructions to clerk;

 03 /13/20  MJV  0.10  Conducting British Columbia PPSA search;

 03 /13/20  MJV  0.20  Reporting to receiver; 

 03 /18/20  MJV  0.10  Reporting to receiver regarding BC Ministry of 
 Finance registrations; 

 05 /25/20  MJV  0.10  Email from and to your Arif Dhanani;

 05 /26/20  MJV  0.60  Reviewing and revising Fourth Report;

 05 /26/20  MJV  1.90  Drafting notice of motion and discharge Order; 
 drafting fee affidavit;

 05 /26/20  MJV  0.40  Reviewing and revising same; email to Receiver;

 05 /26/20  MJV  0.10  Emails from and to receiver;

 05 /27/20  MJV  1.20  Drafting factum;



 Account payable upon receipt.  In accordance with the Section 33 of the Solicitors Act, interest will be charged at the annual rate stated 
 calculated from 30 days after delivery of this account.  A receipted account will not be mailed unless requested by you

 May 29/20 19L0200  2 Page

 4.00% Interest Rate  Account Payable upon receipt.  In accordance with the Section 33 of the Solicitors Act, interest will be charged at the annual rate stated calculated from 30 days after delivery of this account.  A receipted account will not be mailed unless requested by you.

 MATTER #  2 Page 162600
 May 29, 2020

 05 /27/20  MJV  0.10  Emails from and to receiver;

 05 /28/20  MJV  1.80  Drafting, reviewing and revising factum and 
 instructions regarding book of authorities;

 05 /28/20  MJV  0.10  Telephone attendance with Trial Co-ordinator;

 05 /29/20  MJV  0.80  Reviewing and revising motion materials; 
 instructions to clerk; reviewing and revising Service 
 List;

 TIMEKEEPER SUMMARY

 Timekeeper  ID  Hours  Rate  Total

 $4,165.00 $490.00 8.50 MJV MICHAEL J. VALENTE

 $4,165.00 TOTAL FEES:

 PLUS 
 H.S.T.

 GRAND
 TOTAL

 H.S.T 
 NON-

 EXEMPT

 H.S.T
 EXEMPT DISBURSEMENTS

 PLUS
 H.S.T. FEE

 $4,706.45 $541.45 $4,165.00

 $25.00 $25.00 PHOTOCOPIES

 $122.50 $122.50 PPSA SEARCH(ES)/REGISTRATION

 /  Val Luis

 $5,821.70 BALANCE DUE NOW

 $11,665.84 PREVIOUS PAYMENTS

 $12,614.41 PREVIOUS AMOUNT OWING

 E. & O.E.
   / MJV

 MICHAEL J. VALENTE

 $19.18

 SCARFONE HAWKINS LLP

 THIS IS OUR ACCOUNT,

 Per:

 $4,873.13 BALANCE DUE TO THIS OFFICE:

 $4,873.13 $0.00  $147.50 $541.45 $4,165.00



 Account payable upon receipt.  In accordance with the Section 33 of the Solicitors Act, interest will be charged at the annual rate stated 
 calculated from 30 days after delivery of this account.  A receipted account will not be mailed unless requested by you

 May 29/20 19L0200  3 Page

 4.00% Interest Rate  Account Payable upon receipt.  In accordance with the Section 33 of the Solicitors Act, interest will be charged at the annual rate stated calculated from 30 days after delivery of this account.  A receipted account will not be mailed unless requested by you.

 MATTER #  3 Page 162600
 May 29, 2020

 RECEIPTS DISBURSEMENTS
 TRUST STATEMENT

 ITEM DATE

 $0.00 TRUST BALANCE

 MICHAEL J. VALENTE

 ___________ ___________

 $0.00 $0.00 TOTAL

 SCARFONE HAWKINS LLP
 Per:
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EXHIBIT “B” 
 
Fee Summary: 
 

Professional Level Hours Rate Fees 
 
Michael J. Valente 

 
Partner 

 
27.2 

 
$490.00 

 
$13,047.50 

 
Colleen Yamashita 

 
Partner 

 
1.65 

 
$350.00 

 
$    577.50 

 
Danielle Iampietro 

 
Partner 

 
0.40 

 
$460.00 

 
$    184.00 

 
Mark Milanetti 

 
Associate 

 
0.10 

 
$200.00 

 
$      20.00 

 
Articling Students 

 
AS 

 
4.55 

 
$145.00 

 
$    659.75 

 
Total Hours & professional 
Fees 

  
33.90 

 
 

 
$14,488.75 

 
HST @ 13.0% 

  
 

  
$  1,883.54 

 
TOTAL: 

    
$16,372.29 

 
 

CALCULATION OF AVERAGE HOURLY BILLING RATE OF 
SCARFONE HAWKINS LLP 

 
Billing Period Total Fees HST Hours Average 

Hourly Rate 
 
October 1/19 to May 29/20 

 
$14,488.75 

 
$1,883.54 

 
33.90 

 
$427.40 

 
 



 
CANADIAN IMPERIAL BANK OF COMMERCE -and- AMAX HEALTH INC. 
Applicant  Respondents 

 

 Court File No. 19-69485 
  

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

COMMERCIAL LIST 
 

PROCEEDING COMMENCED AT HAMILTON 
 

 AFFIDAVIT OF KAUSH PARAMESWARAN 

  
SCARFONE HAWKINS LLP 
Barristers & Solicitors 
One James Street South 
14th Floor 
P.O. Box 926, Depot 1 
Hamilton, Ontario 
L8N 3P9 
 
Michael J. Valente (LSUC # 23925R) 
mvalente@shlaw.ca 
Tel: 905-523-1333 
Fax: 905-523-5878 
 
Lawyers for the receiver, RSM Canada Limited  

RCP-E 4C (July 1, 2007) 
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Court File No. CV-19-69485

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE

IN THE MATTER BETWEEN CANADIAN IMPERIAL BANK OF COMMERCE
(APPLICANT) AND AMEX HEALTH INC. (RESPONDENT)

AFFIDAVIT OF AMANDA PLASTINA
(sworn October 7, 2019)

I, AMANDA PLASTINA, of the City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario, MAKE

OATH AND SAY:

1. I am a partner with the law firm of Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP (“Norton

Rose”), special counsel to RSM Canada Limited, in its capacity as receiver in these

proceedings (the “Receiver”), and as such, have knowledge of the matters herein deposed

to.

2. I hereby confirm that attached as Exhibit “A” is a true copy of the account of Norton

Rose for the period of August 9, 2019 ending September 26, 2019. I confirm that this

account accurately reflects the services provided by Norton Rose in this matter for this period

and the fees and disbursements claimed by it for this period.

SWORN BEFORE ME at the City of
To o, October7,2019.

Co miss ne or ta’kTng Oaths

//tZq
Amanda Plastina



EXHIBIT “A”

Norton Rose Account

(See Attached)



INVOICE

Invoice Number

Matter Number

Invoice Date

NRF Contact

Your Reference

9090161567

1001085569

September 26, 2019

Amanda Plastina

NA - Paper Invoice

A

NORTON ROSE FULBRIGHT
Norton Rose Fuibright Canada LLP
222 Bay Street, Suite 3000, P.O. Box 53
Toronto ON M5K 1E7
Canada

Tel: +1 416-216-4000

Fax: +1 416-216-3930

www.nortonrosefulbrightcom

GST/HST No. 111340006

Accounts Contact:
nrcreceivables@nortonrosefulbright.com

For the attention of: Arif Dhanani,

Vice President

RSM Canada Limited
11 King St. West, Suite 700
Box 27
Toronto ON M5H4C7

Amax Health Inc.

Professional Services Rendered to August 31, 2019 Charges

CAD

SUMMARY

Payable in 30 days
PAYMENT INFORMATION

Taxable Fees

Taxable Disbursements

Taxable Amount

HST 13.000%

Non-Taxable Disbursements

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE AND PAYABLE

3,042.50

87.00

3,129.50
406.84

58.00

CAD 3,594.34

RBC Financial Group, I Place Ville Marie, Montreal, Québec, CANADA H3C 385, Bank 003, Transit 00001, ACC. No. 161-327-2, Swift Code #
ROYCCAT2. Include invoice number on transfer order.



A
NORTON ROSE FULBRIGHT

Invoice Date September 26, 2019 Invoice Number 9090161567

Matter Description Amax Health Inc.

Matter Number 1001085569

Amax Health Inc.

TIME DETAILS

DATE NAME HOURS DESCRIPTION

08/09/2019 Mooney, j 0.30 Call with NRF Toronto regarding security review.

08/09/2019 Plastina, A 0.30 Call with NRF Calgart regarding security review.

08/12/2019 Ha, H 0.90 Receiving instructions from J.Mooney. Drafting email for the Alberta
searches request. Reviewing Loan Documents.

08/12/2019 Mooney, J 0.80 Correspondence with J. Ha regarding public searches. Meeting with
J. Ha regarding same.

08/12/2019 Plastina, A 0.50 Review of security report and provided comments.

08/13/2019 Assis, L 0.60 Receipt of instructions. Ordering various due diligence searches on
Amax Health Inc. Conducting Alberta PPR and Corporate search.
Requesting pre-screen Nuans across Canada. Forwarding search
results to J. Mooney and J. Ha. Reporting that Corporation is
registering in Ontario.

08/13/2019 Assis, L 0.20 Ordering Workplace Health & Safety Branch search on Amax Health
Inc.

08/13/2019 Assis, L 0.20 Receipt of Bank Act search results. Forwarding same to J. Ha.

08/13/2019 Mooney, J 0.20 Correspondence with L. Assis and J. Ha regarding public searches.

08/14/2019 Assis, L 0.30 Receipt of Queen’s Bench and Provincial search results. Forwarding
same to J. Ha.

08/19/2019 Ha, H 0.50 Draft Schedule for the Alberta Security Review summarizing
searches results

08/19/2019 Mooney, J 1 .70 Draft security review. Email correspondence with NRF deal team
regarding same.

08/19/2019 Plastina, A 0.50 Reviewed and provided comments on revised security report.

08/19/2019 Wang, R 0.20 Review WCB certificate. Advise J. Mooney on WCB certificate.

08/20/2019 Mooney, J 0.40 Finalize security revise and deliver same.

Total 7.60

TIME SUMMARY

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

This invoice may include fees and disbursements of the member firms of Norton Rose Fuibright. Such fees and disbursements of member firms other
than Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP are invoiced and collected by Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP as agent of the relevant member firm.
Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP is a limited liability partnership established in Canada. Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright
LLP, Norton Rose Fuibright Australia, Norton Rose Fulbright South Africa Inc. and Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP are separate legal entities and all of
them are members of Norton Rose Fulbright, a Swiss verein. Norton Rose Fulbright helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not itself
provide legal services to clients, For more information, see nortonrosefulbright.com.



A
NORTON ROSE FULBRIGHT

Invoice Date September 26, 2019 Invoice Number 9090161567

Matter Description Amax Health Inc.

Matter Number 1001085569

Partner

Plastina, A 1.30 720.00 936.00

Sub Total 936.00

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Associate

Mooney, J 3.40 390.00 1,326.00

Wang, R 0.20 450.00 90.00

Sub Total 1,416.00

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Paralegal

Assis, L 1.30 235.00 305.50

Sub Total 305.50

NAME HOURS RATE AMOUNT

Trainee

Ha, H 1.40 275.00 385.00

Sub Total 385.00

Total 7.60 3,042.50

DISBURSEMENT SUMMARY

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT

Non-Taxable

Search Fee 1 .00 58.00

Taxable

Search Fee 1 .00 87.00

TOTAL 145.00

This invoice may include fees and disbursements of the member firms of Norton Rose Fulbright. Such fees and disbursements of member firms other
than Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP are invoiced and collected by Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP as agent of the relevant member firm.
Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP is a limited liability partnership established in Canada. Norton Rose Fulbright Canada LLP, Norton Rose Fuibright
LLP, Norton Rose Fulbright Australia, Norton Rose Fuibright South Africa Inc. and Norton Rose Fulbright US LLP are separate legal entities and all of
them are members of Norton Rose Fulbright, a Swiss verein. Norton Rose Fulbright helps coordinate the activities of the members but does not itself
provide legal services to clients. For more information, see nortonrosefulbright.com.
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